
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ITB #: 19-032V Tentative Board Meeting Date*: AUGUST 07, 2018 

ITB Title: TEMPORARY TRADESPEOPLE STAFFING # Notified: 296 # Downloaded:  23 

SERVICES # of Responses Rec’d: 7 # of “No Bids”: 0 

For: PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS ITB Opening Date : MAY 07, 2018 
(School/Department) 

Fund: DEPARTMENT’S OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: APRIL 10, 2018    

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & 
Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on MAY 21, 2018 @ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any person who is adversely 
affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended 
decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or 
failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The 
formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during 
which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of 
Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting 
an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward 
County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 
3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 
date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

  VENDOR NAME(S)   ITEM(S) AWARDED 

 A & ASSOCIATES, INC “A” THROUGH “U” 

 4 BEST BUSINESS CORP. d/b/a 4BB CORP. “A” THROUGH “U” 

 KEMP GROUP INTERNATIONAL CORP. “A” THROUGH “U” 

 PACKPLUS INC. d/b/a JOSMAR MEDICAL STAFFING “A” THROUGH “U” 

 UNION TEMPORARY SERVICES, INC. “A” THROUGH “L”, “N” THROUGH “P”, 
“R” THROUGH “U” 

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS, 
AND CONDITIONS.  

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS AS STATED, 
EITHER IN THEIR ENTIRETY OR FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEM(S) LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH BID 
REQUIREMENTS. 

CONTRACT PERIOD:  OCTOBER 01, 2018 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2021 

By: Date: MAY 21, 2018 
(Purchasing Agent) 
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Bid #:  19-032V
Purchasing Agent:  Mayra Tobar

Bid Opened: May 07, 2018

Item Description  Hourly Rate  Overtime  Hourly Rate  Overtime  Hourly Rate  Overtime  Hourly Rate  Overtime  Hourly Rate  Overtime 

A AIR CONDITIONING AND REFRIGERATION MECHANIC – Journeyperson  $              21.60  $              32.40  $              22.30  $              33.45  $              33.75  $              46.88  $              21.76  $              31.44  $              89.30  $            132.45 

B CARPENTER – Journeyperson  $              27.00  $              40.50  $              15.80  $              23.70  $              26.58  $              36.92  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              59.50  $              81.30 

C ELECTRICIAN – Journeyperson  $              36.45  $              54.68  $              22.30  $              33.45  $              32.81  $              45.56  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              79.60  $            113.75 

D ELECTRONIC TECHNICIAN – Fire Alarm  $              20.25  $              30.38  $              22.30  $              33.45  $              27.00  $              37.50  $              19.43  $              27.97  $              79.60  $            113.75 

E ELECTRONIC TECHNICIAN – Communications Equipment  $              25.65  $              38.48  $              22.30  $              33.45  $              27.00  $              37.50  $              19.43  $              27.97  $              79.60  $            113.75 

F GLAZIER – Journeyperson  $              29.70  $              44.55  $              17.50  $              26.25  $              24.77  $              34.41  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              51.25  $              69.50 

G LOCK AND HARDWARE MECHANIC - Journeyperson  $              24.30  $              36.45  $              19.00  $              28.50  $              22.80  $              31.67  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              51.60  $              69.35 

H LABORER  $              16.20  $              24.30  $              13.90  $              20.85  $              17.73  $              24.62  $              14.82  $              21.05  $              31.15  $              41.70 

I MASON - Journeyperson  $              21.60  $              32.40  $              17.00  $              25.50  $              27.90  $              38.76  $              19.45  $              27.97  $              45.90  $              63.90 

J PAINTER – Journeyperson  $              20.25  $              30.38  $              14.75  $              22.13  $              21.87  $              30.38  $              17.13  $              24.51  $              36.95  $              49.00 

K PLUMBER – Journeyperson  $              24.30  $              36.45  $              18.85  $              28.28  $              31.40  $              43.61  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              69.70  $              96.05 

L SPRINKLER MECHANIC – Journeyperson  $              27.00  $              40.50  $              18.40  $              27.60  $              27.47  $              38.16  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              69.70  $              96.05 

M ROOFER – Journeyperson  $              24.30  $              36.45  $              13.00  $              19.50  $              21.82  $              30.30  $              17.15  $              24.42  NO BID  NO BID 

N SHEET METAL MECHANIC  $              24.30  $              36.45  $              18.40  $              27.60  $              28.86  $              40.09  $              20.58  $              29.69  $              57.20  $              77.00 

O WELDER - Journeyperson  $              33.75  $              50.63  $              17.00  $              25.50  $              23.56  $              32.72  $              17.15  $              24.42  $              69.70  $              96.05 

P MAINTENANCE WORKER / CONSTRUCTION TRADES HELPER  $              16.20  $              24.30  $              15.00  $              22.50  $              20.14  $              27.98  $              15.97  $              22.78  $              45.80  $              62.15 

Q CLERK SPECIALIST  $              16.20  $              24.30  $              13.05  $              19.58  $              16.88  $              23.44  $              15.52  $              22.34  NO BID  NO BID 

R CUSTODIAN / FACILITIES SERVICEPERSON  $              16.20  $              24.30  $              12.39  $              18.59  $              16.04  $              22.28  $              14.82  $              21.05  $              31.15  $              41.70 

S FENCE INSTALLER  $              17.55  $              26.33  $              17.50  $              26.25  $              19.48  $              27.06  $              16.00  $              22.80  $              59.50  $              81.30 

T HEAVY EQUIPMENT OPERATOR  $              24.30  $              36.45  $              18.00  $              27.00  $              25.64  $              35.61  $              18.28  $              26.24  $              59.80  $              82.20 

U PIPEFITTER  $              21.60  $              32.40  $              18.85  $              28.28  $              33.35  $              46.31  $              19.45  $              27.99  $              89.30  $            132.45 

REMARKS:
BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY:  David Mammel
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Mayra Tobar
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Title:   TEMPORARY TRADESPEOPLE STAFFING SERVICES

A & Associates 4BB Corp Kemp Group Int'l Packplus d/b/a Josmar 
Medical Staffing

Union Temporary Services 
Inc.
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BID REJECTION SHEET 
ITB 19-032V 

TEMPORARY TRADESPEOPLE STAFFING SERVICES 

It is recommended that for reasons stated below, the bids as stated be rejected for not complying with bid 
requirements. 

1) Reject bid from GL Staffing Services, Inc.  Section 7, Bid Summary Sheet, states:  “Vendor must
fill out the attached Summary Sheet electronically with the corresponding prices per unit of
measure as stated. No handwritten summary sheets will be accepted”.  Bidder is not responsive
as they failed to submit an electronic Summary Sheet, the prices are handwritten.

2) Reject bid from Spur Employment Inc.  Section 12, Bidder’s References, states: “Bidders must
provide with the bid, a list of references from three established firms for whom bidder is
presently providing temporary personnel.  Firms must be located within the tri-county area
(Miami-Dade, Broward and Palm Beach)”.  Bidder is not responsive as they failed to submit
references from Firms located in the tri-county area.  All references submitted are from out-of-state.
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